5 April 1991] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1401

Cw303 LEGAL PRACTITIONERS ACT 1893
BARRISTERS’ BOARD AMENDMENT RULES (No. 2) 1991

Made by the Barristers’ Board under section 6.

Citation

1. These rules may be cited as the Barristers’ Board Amendment Rules (No. 2)
1991. '

Principal rules

2. In these rules the Barristers’ Board Rules 1949* are referred to as the
principal rules.

[*Reprinted in the Gazette of 6 May 1987 at pp. 2011-2058. For amendments
to 26 March 1991 see p. 286 of 1989 Index to Legislation of Western Australia
and Gazettes of 2 March 1990 pp. 1288-89 and 8 March 1991 pp. 1031-32.]

Rule 51A amended
3. Rule 51A of the principal rules is amended—
/ (a) in paragraph (a), by deleting “$450” and substituting the following—
, “ $500 ”; and
7 (b) in paragraph (b}, by deleting “$550” and substituting the following—
“ §700 .
Rule 60 amended
4. Rule 60 of the principal rules is amended—
(a) by deleting “$100” and substituting the following—
“ $200 ”; and
(b) by deleting “$50” and substituting the following—
“ $100 ™.

/

K. H. PARKER, Member.
R. E. BIRMINGHAM, Member.
G. B. NELSON, Member.
R. G. WALTON, Member.



