28 June 1991} GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 3233

|  OccupATIONAL HEAUTH SAFETY AND WELFARE

0A301

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH, SAFETY AND WELFARE ACT 1984

OCCUPATIONAL HEALTH, SAFETY AND WELFARE AMENDMENT
REGULATIONS (No. 6) 1991

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Occupational Health, Safety and
Welfare Amendment Regulations (No. 6) 1991.

Commencement

2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 July, 1991.

Principal regulations

3. In these regulations the Occupational Health, Safety and Welfare Regula-
tions 1988* are referred to as the principal regulations.

[*Published in the Gazette of 16 September 1988 at pp. 3767-3911. For
amendments to 19 June 1991 see pp. 323-324 of 1990 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia and Gazettes of 4 January and 24 May 1991.]

Regulation 505 amended

4. Regulation 505 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation
(5) (c) by deleting “$220” and substituting the following—

“ $230 .
Regulation 603 amended

5. Regulation 603 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation
(3) (a) by deleting “$60” and subst_ituting the following—

“ $65 ”.
Regulation 823 amended

6. Regulation 823 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (2)
by deleting “$2 400" and substituting the following—

“ $2500 "
Regulation 1007 amended

7. Regulation 1007 of the principal regulations is amended in paragraph (a)
by deleting “$20” and substituting the following—

“ $25 .
Regulation 1011amended

8. Regulation 1011 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting “$20”
and substituting the following—

“ $25 .
By His Excellency’s Command,
L. M. AULD, Clerk of the Council.




