
28 June 19911 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

3119 

CS1MIH IAFFAIRS 
4.1,4VP:434.Ni. 

CN301 

REAL ESTATE AND BUSINESS AGENTS ACT 1978 
REAL ESTATE AND BUSINESS AGENTS (GENERAL) 

AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1991 
Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 
Citation 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Real Estate and Business Agents 
(General) Amendment Regulations 1991. 
Regulation 11AA amended 
2. Regulation 11AA of the Real Estate and Business Agents (General) Regula-
tions 1979* is amended— 

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting "49%" and substituting the following-
" 25% "; 

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting "1%" and substituting the following-
" 50% "; 
and 

(c) in paragraph (c) by deleting "50%" and substituting the following-
" 25% ". 

r Reprinted in the Gazette of 26 November 1982 at pp. 4667-74. For subsequent 
amendments to 17 June 1991 see 1990 Index to Legislation of Western Australia, 
pp. 344-5.1 

By His Excellency's Command, 
L. M. AULD, Clerk of the Council. 


