
3472 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[12 July 1991 

MN302 

EXPLOSIVES AND DANGEROUS GOODS ACT 1961 
EXPLOSIVES AND DANGEROUS GOODS (FEES AMENDMENT) 

REGULATIONS 1991 
Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Part 1—Preliminary 
Citation 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Explosives and Dangerous Goods (Fees 
Amendment) Regulations 1991. 
Commencement 
2. These regulations shall come into operation on 15 July 1991. 

Part 2—Dangerous Goods (Road Transport) Regulations 1983 
Provisions amended 
3. A provision of the Dangerous Goods (Road Transport) Regulations 1983* 
specified in column 1 of the Table to this regulation is amended in the manner 
specified opposite and corresponding to that provision in column 2 of that Table. 



12 July 199111 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 3473 

Table 
Column 1 Column 2 
Provision Amendment 

Regulation 203 (2) (d) Delete "$178" and substitute "$191" 
Regulation 207 (2) (e) Delete "$178" and substitute "$191" 
Regulation 404 (1) Delete "$89" and substitute "$95" 
Regulation 408 (1) Delete "$89" and substitute "$95" 
Regulation 409 Delete "$11.80" and substitute "$12.70" 
Regulation 803 (1) Delete 17.00" and substitute "$7.50" 
Regulation 805 (1) Delete "$7.00" and substitute "$7.50" 

[*published in the Gazette on 20 September 1983 at pp.  3517-753. For 
amendments to 25 June 1991, see 1990 Index to Legislation of Western Australia 
at pp. 230-32.] 

Part 3-Explosives Regulations 1963 

Principal regulations 
4. In this Part, the Explosives Regulations 1963* are referred to as the principal 
regulations. 

[*Reprinted in the Gazette on 13 January 1981 at pp. 53-98. For amendments 
to 25 June 1991, see 1990 Index to Legislation of Western Australia at pp.  232-33 
and Gazette of 18 January 1991 at p. 235.1 

Regulation 1 amended 
5. Regulation 1 of the principal regulations is amended by repealing subregula-
tion (3). 

Second Schedule repealed and Second Schedule substituted 
6. The Second Schedule to the principal regulations is repealed and the 
following Schedule is substituted- 

Second Schedule 
Fees 

$ 
Licence to import explosives 127.00 
Licence to manufacture explosives- 

(i) Fireworks 37.00 
(ii) Any other explosives 254.00 

Licence to manufacture blasting agent 25.20 
Licence to sell explosives 37.00 
Licence to store explosives- 

Licensed premises Mode A 25.20 
Licensed premises Mode B 63.00 
Magazine not exceeding 1 000 kilograms 63.00 
Magazine exceeding 1 000 but not exceeding 5 000 

kilograms 95.00 
Magazine exceeding 5 000 kilograms 254.00 

Licence to convey explosives 37.00 
Authorization of explosive 95.00 
Transfer of any licence 12.70 
Storage in public magazine- 

For each package and for each week or part thereof 1.07 
Inspection and testing fees- 

For each sample submitted to "Heat Test" 3.80 
Inspection of packages damaged per day or part thereof 191.00 
Inspection of ships conveying explosives per day or part 

thereof 191.00 
Inspection for certificate of release 114.00 

Tonnage fees for magazines erected on explosives reserves 
(for every 1 000 kilograms of licensed capacity) 

(a) Magazine keeper in charge 159,00 
(b) No supervision provided 31.20 

Shotfirer's permit, issue and renewal 12.70 
Examination for shotfirer's permit 114.00 
Issue of entry permit 114.00 
Permit for purchase and use of fireworks 114.00 
Examination of vehicle for conveyance of explosives 191.00 
Initial approval of equipment used for or in connection with 

detonation of explosives 222.00 
Testing of equipment for or in connection with detonation 

of explosives-per unit 12.70. 



3474 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	(12  July 1991 

Part 4—Flammable Liquids Regulations 1967 

Regulation 156 amended 
7. Regulation 156 of the Flammable Liquids Regulations 1967* is amended—

(a) by repealing subregulation (1) and substituting the following subregu-
lation— 

" (1) The annual fees payable for each licence and for the renewal 
of same shall be, for each licensed premises in which the 
approved liquid storage- 

$ 
Does not exceed 2.3 kilolitres 	 12.70 
Exceeds 2.3 but does not exceed 23 kilolit- 	25.20 
res 
Exceeds 23 but does not exceed 46 kilolit- 	63.00 
res 
Exceeds 46 but does not exceed 230 kilolit- 	159.00 
res 
Exceeds 230 but does not exceed 2 300 	317.00 
kilolitres 
Exceeds 2 300 but does not exceed 4 600 	1 016.00 
kilolitres 
Exceeds 4 600 but does not exceed 9 200 	1 525.00 
kilolitres 
Exceeds 9 200 but does not exceed 13 800 	1 905.00 
kilolitres 
Exceeds 13 800 but does not exceed 18 400 	2 289.00 
kilolitres 
Exceeds 18 400 but does not exceed 23 000 	2 670.00 
kilolitres 
Exceeds 23 000 kilolitres 	 3 175.00 "; 

(b) in subregulation (3) by deleting "$11.80" and substituting the follow-
ing—
" $12.70 "; 

(c) in subregulation (4) by deleting "$11.80" and substituting the follow-
ing—
" $12.70 "; 

(d) in subregulation (5) by deleting 1178.00" and substituting the follow-
ing—
" $191.00 "; and 

(e) in subregulation (6) by deleting 1207.00" and substituting the follow
ing— 

$222.00 ". 
[*Reprinted in the Gazette on 8 July 1980. For amendments to 25 June 1991, 

see 1990 Index to Legislation of Western Australia at p. 233 and Gazette of 18 
January 1991 at p. 234.] 
By His Excellency's Command, 

L. AULD, Clerk of the Council. 


