
18 October 1991] 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

5309 

AGRICULTURE 

AG301 

AERIAL SPRAYING CONTROL ACT 1966 

SPRAYING CONTHOL AMENDMENT REGULAT/ONS 1991 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Aerial Spraying Control 
Amendment Regulations 1991. 

Principal regulations 

2. In these regulations the Aerial Spraying Control Regulations* are 
referred to as the principal regulations. 

[ 	Published in the Gazette of 11 October 1983 at pp.4137-46. 
For amendments to 24 September 1991 see page 183 of 1990 Index 
to Legislation of Western Australia.] 

Regulation 4 amended 

3. Regulation 4 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (3) 
(b) by deleting "$7.00" and substituting the following — 

" 	$7.50 	". 



5310 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[18 October 1991 

Regulation 9 amended 

4. 	Regulation 9 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (2) 
(b) by deleting "$14.00" and substituting the following — 

" 	$15.00 

By His Excellency's Command, 
L. M. AULD, Clerk of the Council. 


