
6162 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 
	

[13 December 1991 

CN316 	 TRAVEL AGENTS ACT 1985 

TRAVEL AGENTS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS (NO. 2) 1991 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Travel Agents Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 1991. 

Principal regulations 

2. In these regulations the Travel Agents Regulations 1986* are referred to 
as the principal regulations. 

[* Published in the Gazette on 19 December 1986 at pp.4926-38. 
_ 	For amendments to 12 August 1991 see pp.386-7 of 1990 Index to 

Legislation of Western Australia.] 



13 December 19911 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 6163 

Regulation 6 amended 

3. 	Regulation 6 of the principal regulations is amended - 

(a) 	in subregulation (1) - 

(ii) by deleting "$241" wherever it occurs and substituting in 
each place the following - 

" 	$320 

(ii) by deleting "$54" wherever it occurs and substituting in 
each place the following - 

$69 ";and 

(iii) by deleting "$365" and substituting the following - 

$480 

and 

(b) in subregulation (2) by deleting "$500" and substituting the 
following - 

$690 ". 

Regulation 10 amended 

43. 	Regulation 10 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation 
(3) (c) by deleting "$110" and substituting the following - 

$117 

Regulation 11 amended 

5. 	Regulation 11 of the principal regulations is amended - 

(a) 	in subregulation (1) - 

(i) by deleting "$300" wherever it occurs and substituting in 
each place the following - 

" 	$320 

(ii) by deleting "$65" wherever it occurs and substituting in 
each place the following - 

$69 

and 

(iii) by deleting "$450" and substituting the following - 

$480 

and 



6164 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[13 December 1991 

(b) 	in subregulation (2) by deleting "$500" and substituting the 
following— 

$690. 

By His Excellency's Command, 
M. C. WAUCHOPE, Clerk of the Council. 


