
4698 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[7 September 1990 

PE301 	 FIREARMS ACT 1973 
FIREARMS AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1990 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 
Citation 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Firearms Amendment Regulations 
1990. 
Commencement 
2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 October 1990. 
Principal Regulations 
3. In these regulations the Firearms Regulations 1974* are referred to as the 
principal regulations. 

(*Reprinted in the Gazette of 17 February 1981 at pp. 663-697. For amend- 
ments to 30 July 1990 see p. 230 of 1989 Index to Legislation of Western 
Australia.) 
Regulation 4 amended 
4. Regulation 4 of the principal regulations is amended— 

(a) in subregulation (1a) by deleting the table to that subregulation and 
substituting the following table— 

Table of Application Forms and Fees 

Form 	 Kind of Licence 	 Fee Noting fee 
No. 

$ 	$ 
1 Firearm Licence 	  17 8 
2 Firearms Curio Licence 	  31 8 
4 Corporate Licence 	  56 8 

.; 



7 September 1990] 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4699 

(b) in subregulation (lb) (a) by deleting "$7" and substituting the follow-
ing— 
" $8 ";and 

(c) in subregulation (lc) by deleting the table to that subregulation and 
substituting the following table— 

Table of Application Forms and Fees 

Form 	 Kind of Licence 	 Fee 
No. 

$ 
5 Dealer's Licence 	  56 
6 Repairer's Licence 	  31 
7 Manufacturer's Licence 	  31 
8 Shooting Gallery Licence 	 31 

Regulation 5 amended 
5. Regulation 5 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (1) (b) 
by deleting "$2" and substituting the following— 
“ $3  ”. 

Regulation 11 amended 
6. Regulation 11 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (1) 
by deleting "$9” and substituting the following— 
• $10 ". 

Regulation 21 amended 
7. Regulation 21 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (1) 
by deleting "$3" and substituting the following— 
" $4 ". 

Regulation 27 amended 
8. Regulation 27 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (1) 
(a) by deleting "$47" and substituting the following— 

• $51 ”. 
By His Excellency's Command, 

G. PEARCE, Clerk of the Council. 


