
7 September 19907 
	

GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4701 

PE305 	
ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974 

ROAD TRAFFIC (DRIVERS' LICENCES) AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 
(No. 3) 1990 

Made by his Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 

1. These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Drivers' Licences) 
Amendment Regulations (No. 3) 1990. 

Commencement 

2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 October 1990. 

Principal regulations 

3. In these regulations the Road Traffic (Drivers' Licence) Regulations 1975* 
are referred to as the principal regulations. 

[*Reprinted in the Gazette of 2 July 1986 at pp. 2263-75. For amendments to 24 
July 1990 see p. 336 of 1989 Index to Legislation of Western Australia and 
Gazette of 30 March 19901 

Regulation 9 amended 

4. 	Regulation 9 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$7.00" and 
substituting the following— 

$8.00 ". 

Regulation 14A amended 

5. Regulation 14A of the principal regulations is amended— 
(a) in item 1 (a) by deleting "40.00" and substituting the following—

" 43.00 ". 
(b) in item 1 (b) by deleting "32.00" and substituting the following-

34.00 ''; and 
(c) in item 2 by deleting "16.50" and substituting the following-

19.00 ". 

Regulation 15 amended 

6. Regulation 15 of the principal regulations is amended— 

(a) in subregulation (1)— 
(i) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$60.00" and substituting the follow-

ing— 

" $64.00 "; and 
(ii) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$120.00" and substituting the 

following— 

$128.00 "; 
and 

(b) in subregulation (2)— 
(i) in paragraph (a) by deleting "$9.00" and substituting the follow-

ing— 

" $9.50 ". and 
(ii) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$17.50" and substituting the follow-

ing— 

" $19.00 ". 

By His Excellency's Command, 	
G. PEARCE, Clerk of the Council. 


