
4940 	 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	[21 September 1990 

PE301 

ROAD TRAFFIC ACT 1974 
ROAD TRAFFIC (LICENSING) AMENDMENT REGULATIONS (No. 2) 1990 

Made by His Excellency the Governor in Executive Council. 

Citation 
1. These regulations may be cited as the Road Traffic (Licensing) Amendment 
Regulations (No. 2) 1990. 
Commencement 
2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 October 1990. 

Principal regulations 
3. In these regulations the Road Traffic (Licensing) Regulations 1975* are 
referred to as the principal regulations. 
(*Reprinted in the Gazette of 28 August 1984 at pp. 2263-2282. For amendments 
to 10 August 1990 see pp. 336-38 of 1989 Index to Legislation of Western 
Australia.) 
Regulation 3 amended 
4. Regulation 3 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (1) by 
inserting after the definition of "licensee" the following definition— 

"manufacturer's gross vehicle mass" means the value recorded by the 
Board as the maximum laden mass recommended by the manufac-
turer, by specification or otherwise, at which that vehicle, or a vehicle 
of the same make and class or series, or a similar class or series, 
should be operated; ". 

Regulation 3B amended 
5. Regulation 3B of the principal regulations is amended— 

(a) in subregulation (1) by deleting paragraphs (a), (b), (c), (d) and (e) and 
substituting the following— 

(a) Motor wagon, prime mover with a manufacturer's 
gross vehicle mass of or exceeding 4.5 tonnes, and 
any other vehicle of or exceeding 4.5 tonnes 	 $42.00 

(b) Caravan and trailer without brakes, motor cycle, 
motor carrier, engine change, earthmoving or 
agricultural implement 	 $19.00 

(c) Any other vehicle 	  $25.00 

and 
(b) in subregulation (2a) by deleting "to which subregulation (1) (b), (e), (d) 

or (e) applies," and substituting the following—. 
other than an earthmoving or agricultural implement, to 

which subregulation (1) applies, ". 

Regulation 8B amended 
6. Regulation 8B of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$11.00." 
and substituting the following— 

$12.00. ". 
Regulation 11 amended 
7. Regulation 11 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (6) 
(a) (i) by deleting "$3.50" and substituting the following— 

" $5.00 ". 
Regulation 14 amended 
8. Regulation 14 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting "$4.00" and 
substituting the following— 

$5.00 ". 

Regulation 22 amended 
9. Regulation 22 of the principal regulations is amended— 

(a) in subregulation (2)— 

(i) in paragraph (a) by deleting 19.00" and substituting the follow-
ing— 

" $10.00 "; 
(ii) in paragraph (b) by deleting "$70.00" and substituting the follow-

ing— 
" $75.00 "; and 



21 September 1990] 	GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 	 4941 

(iii) in paragraph (c) by deleting "$23.00" and substituting the follow-
ing— 
" $25.00 "; 

(b) in subregulation (2aa) by deleting "$535.00" and substituting the 
following— 

• $572.00 "; 
(c) in subregulation (2b)— 

(i) in paragraph (a) by deleting "5 350.00" and substituting the 
following— 
" 5 725.00 "; 

(ii) in paragraph (b) by deleting "1 070.00" and substituting the 
following— 
" 1 145.00 "; 

(iii) in paragraph (c) by deleting "535.00" and substituting the follow-
ing— 
" 572.00 "; 

(iv) in paragraph (b) by deleting "107.00" and substituting the follow-
ing— 
" 114.00 "; and 

(v) in paragraph (e) by deleting "1 070.00" and substituting the 
following— 
" 1 145.00 "; 

(d) in subregulation (2ba) by deleting "$267.00" and substituting the 
following— 
• $286.00 "; 

(e) in subregulation (2c) by deleting 111.00" and substituting the follow-
ing— 
" $12.00 "; 

(0 in subregulation (2e) by deleting 1107.00" and substituting the 
following— 
• $114.00 "; and 

(g) in subregulation (6) by deleting 111.00" and substituting the follow-
ing— 
" $12.00 ". 

Regulation 25B amended 
10. Regulation 25B of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (2) 
by deleting 111.00" and substituting the following— 

• $12.00 ". 
Regulation 26 amended 
11. Regulation 26 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (3)— 

(a) by deleting "$13.00" and substituting the following— 
• $16.00 "; 

(b) by deleting "$23.00" and substituting the following— 
• $25.00 ". 

Regulation 26A amended 
12. Regulation 26A of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (1) 
by deleting 164.00" and substituting the following— 

• $68.00 ". 
Regulation 30 amended 
13. Regulation 30 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation (3) 
by deleting "two dollars" and substituting the following— 

• $3.00 ". 
By His Excellency's Command, 

G. PEARCE, Clerk of the Council. 


