3208 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA [29 June 1990

ALBANY PORT AUTHORITY ACT 1926
ALBANY PORT AUTHORITY AMENDMENT REGULATIONS 1990
Made by the Albany Port Authority.

Citation

1. These regulations may be cited as the Albany Port Authority Amendment
Regulations 1990.

Commencement
2. These regulations shall come into operation on 1 July 1990.

Principal regulations

3. In these regulations the regulations made under the Albany Port
Authority Act 1926* are referred to as the principal regulations.
[*Published in the Government Gazette on 30 March 1951 at pp. 680-714. For
amendments to 7 June 1990 see pp. 181-84 of 1989 Index to Legislation of
Western Australia.]

Regulation 1A inserted
4. Before the heading “Interpretation” to regulation 1 of the principal
regulations, the following regulation is inserted—
Citation
“1A. These regulations may be cited as the Albany Port Authority
Regulations 1951. .

Regulation 53A amended
5. Regulation 53A of the principal regulations is amended by deleting “15”
and substituting the following—

‘o161 ",

Regulation 58 amended

6. Regulation 58 of the principal regulations is amended in subregulation
(1)—

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “3.06” and substituting the following—
“ 3.29 " and

(b) in paragraph (b) by deleting “1.11" and substituting the following—
(1] 1.19 I)‘

Regulation 74 amended
7. Regulation 74 of the principal regulations is amended under the heading
“SPECIFIC RATES™—

(a) by deleting “1.13” opposite and corresponding to “Grain—Wheat,
barley, oats (loaded by bulk loader)” and substituting the following—

“ 1.18 " and

(b) by deleting “Materials in crude form such as rock phosphate, sulphur,
etc., for the manufacture of manures and acids—in bulk and landed
loose 2 tonne 2.21” and substituting the following—

“ Materials in crude form such as rock phosphate, sulphur, etc., for
the manufacture of manures and acids and manufactured fertilis-
ers such as D.A.P. etc.—

in bulk and landed loose 2 tonne 2.30 .

Regulation 141A amended
8. Regulation 141A of the principal regulations is amended—

(a) in paragraph (a) by deleting “$968” and substituting the following—
“ $1045 ”; and
(b) in paragraph (b)—
(i) by deleting “$245” in subparagraph (i) and substituting the
following—
@ $265 ‘!;
(ii) by deleting “$495” in subparagraph (ii) and substituting the
following—
“ $535 "; and .
(iii) by deleting “$692” in subparagraph (iii) and substituting the
following— :
@ $747 i!’



29 June 1990] GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA

3209

Regulation 283 amended
9. Reguiation 283 of the principal regulations is amended—

(a) in paragraph (a)—
(i) by deleting “$23” in subparagraph (i) and substituting the follow-

ing—
“ $25 ™ and
(ii) by deleting “$39” in subparagraph (ii) and substituting the follow-
ing—

“ $43 ”; and
(b) in paragraph (b)—
(i) by deleting “$15” in subparagraph (i) and substituting the follow-
ing—
“ $17 " and
(ii) by deleting “$27” in subparagraph (ii) and substituting the follow-
ing—
“ $3D ”.
Regulation 286 amended
10. Regulation 286 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting
“$1.94” twice occurring and substituting in each case the following—
“ $2.10 "

Regulation 287 amended
11. Regulation 287 of the principal regulations is amended by deleting “$21”
twice occurring and substituting in each case the following—

“ $23

Passed by a resolution of the Albany Port Authority at a meeting of the Port
Authority held on the eighteenth day of June 1990.

The Common Seal of the Albany Port Authority was at the time of the
above-mentioned resolution affixed in the presence of—

Mr W. J. PLEWRIGHT, Chairman.
Mrs Y. W. ATTWELL, Member.
Mr B. J. E. HUDSON, General Manager.




