
1702 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2023 

EDUCATION 

ED301 

Education Service Providers (Full Fee Overseas Students) Registration 

Act 1991 

School Curriculum and Standards Authority Act 1997 

School Education Act 1999 

Teacher Registration Act 2012 

Education Regulations Amendment (Fees and 

Charges) Regulations 2023 

SL 2023/67 

Made by the Governor in Executive Council. 

Part 1 — Preliminary 

1. Citation 

  These regulations are the Education Regulations Amendment 

(Fees and Charges) Regulations 2023. 

2. Commencement 

  These regulations come into operation as follows — 

 (a) Part 1 — on the day on which these regulations are 

published in the Gazette; 

 (b) the rest of the regulations — on 1 July 2023. 

Part 2 — Education Service Providers (Full Fee 

Overseas Students) Registration Regulations 1992 

amended 

3. Regulations amended 

  This Part amends the Education Service Providers (Full Fee 

Overseas Students) Registration Regulations 1992. 



16 June 2023 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1703 

4. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 

 

Schedule 1 — Fees 

[r. 4] 

 1. For —  

 (a) an application under section 9, 10, 11, 12 or 20(5) 

for registration of an education service provider; 

 (b) an application under regulation 6(1) for renewal of 

the registration of an education service provider; 

 (c) an application under section 18(1) for the 

amendment of a certificate of registration by adding 

1 or more education services: 

 — if the number of full fee overseas 

students at the education service 

provider is less than 10 ........................ $345 

 — if the number of full fee overseas 

students at the education service 

provider is 10 or more ......................... $855 

 2. For an application under section 18(1) for the 

amendment of a certificate of registration by deleting 

1 or more education services........................................ $21 

 3. For a notice under section 18(3) of a change in particulars if 

there is a change in the proprietorship of the education 

service provider:  

 — if the number of full fee overseas 

students at the education service 

provider is less than 10 .................................... $345 

 — if the number of full fee overseas 

students at the education service 

provider is 10 or more ...................................... $855 

 4. For a notice under section 18(3) of any other  

change in particulars .........................................................$21 

 

5. Schedule 2 amended 

  Delete the reference after the heading to Schedule 2 and insert: 

 

  [r. 5] 

 

6. Schedule 3 amended 

  Delete the reference after the heading to Schedule 3 and insert: 

 

  [r. 9] 

 



1704 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2023 

Part 3 — School Curriculum and Standards Authority 

Regulations 2005 amended 

7. Regulations amended 

  This Part amends the School Curriculum and Standards 

Authority Regulations 2005. 

8. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 

 

Schedule 1 — Fees and charges for certification, 

assessment and examination 

[r. 10] 

Item Description Fee/Charge 

 Certification  

1. Copy of student record (s. 19J(1))  ............  $51.00  

(for each 

document) 

2. Change of entry in application for 

certification  ...............................................  $60.00 

3. Secondary education equivalence 

statement ....................................................  $52.00 

 Assessment  

4. Enrolment (late entry)  ...............................  $118.00  

(for each course 

unit to a maximum 

of $2 000.00 per 

application) 

5. Appeal from assessment  ...........................  $28.00  

(for each course 

unit) 

 Examination  

6. Non-school candidate  ...............................  $60.00  

(for each 

examination) 

7. Non-school candidate (late entry)  .............  $118.00  

(for each 

examination) 

8. Non-school candidate (taking examination 

without enrolment)  ...................................  

 

$179.00  

(for each 

examination) 

9. School candidate (taking examination 

without enrolment)  ...................................  

 

$179.00  

(for each 

examination) 



16 June 2023 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1705 

Item Description Fee/Charge 

10. School candidate taking examination in 

Australia but outside the State  ..................  

 

$86.00  

(for each 

examination up to a 

maximum of 

$400.00) 

11. School candidate taking examination 

outside Australia  .......................................  

 

$340.00  

(for each 

examination) 

12. Check of results  ........................................  $51.00  

(for each 

examination) 

13. Statement of raw marks  ............................  $18.00  

(for each 

examination) 

14. Copy of examination script (obtainable 

only during the period of 21 days after 

publication of the examination results)  ....  

 

 

$34.00  

(for each script) 

 

Part 4 — School Education (Student Residential 

Colleges) Regulations 2017 amended 

9. Regulations amended 

  This Part amends the School Education (Student Residential 

Colleges) Regulations 2017. 

10. Regulation 14 amended 

 (1) In regulation 14(7)(a): 

 (a) in subparagraph (i) delete “2021” and insert: 

 

  2024 

 

 (b) in subparagraph (i) delete “$25 000; or” and insert: 

 

  $26 202; or 

 

 (c) in subparagraph (ii) delete “$25 625;” and insert: 

 

  $26 857; 

 



1706 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2023 

 (2) In regulation 14(7)(b): 

 (a) in subparagraph (i) delete “2021” and insert: 

 

  2024 

 

 (b) in subparagraph (i) delete “$14 461; or” and insert: 

 

  $15 157; or 

 

 (c) in subparagraph (ii) delete “$14 823.” and insert: 

 

  $15 536. 

 

Part 5 — Teacher Registration (Accreditation of Initial 

Teacher Education Programmes) Regulations 2012 

amended 

11. Regulations amended 

  This Part amends the Teacher Registration (Accreditation of 

Initial Teacher Education Programmes) Regulations 2012. 

12. Regulation 5 amended 

  In regulation 5(3)(b) delete “$2 185.” and insert: 

 

  $2 256. 

 

13. Regulation 6 amended 

  In regulation 6(4)(b) delete “$2 185.” and insert: 

 

  $2 256. 

 

Part 6 — Teacher Registration (General) 

Regulations 2012 amended 

14. Regulations amended 

  This Part amends the Teacher Registration (General) 

Regulations 2012. 



16 June 2023 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1707 

15. Schedule 1 replaced 

  Delete Schedule 1 and insert: 

 

Schedule 1 — Fees 

[r. 28] 

 Type of fee Provision  

of Act or 

regulations 

Fee 

1. Fee payable by a person who applies for 

provisional registration —  

s. 10(2)(e)  

 (a) if the applicant has a teaching 

qualification from an accredited 

initial teacher education 

programme 

 $140 

 (b) if the applicant has a teaching 

qualification conferred in Australia 

or New Zealand that the applicant 

wishes the Board to recognise as 

equivalent to a teaching 

qualification from an accredited 

initial teacher education 

programme 

 $140 

 (c) if the applicant has a teaching 

qualification conferred in a country 

other than Australia or New 

Zealand that the applicant wishes 

the Board to recognise as 

equivalent to a teaching 

qualification from an accredited 

initial teacher education 

programme 

 $473 

 (d) if the application is in accordance 

with the mutual recognition 

principle or the Trans-Tasman 

mutual recognition principle 

 $140 

 (e) if the applicant holds 

non-practising registration 

 no fee 

2. Fee payable by a person who applies for 

full registration —  

s. 10(2)(e)  

 (a) if the applicant has a teaching 

qualification from an accredited 

initial teacher education 

programme 

 $178 

 (b) if the applicant has a teaching 

qualification conferred in Australia 

or New Zealand that the applicant 

wishes the Board to recognise as 

equivalent to such a qualification 

 $178 



1708 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 16 June 2023 

 Type of fee Provision  

of Act or 

regulations 

Fee 

 (c) if the applicant has a teaching 

qualification conferred in a country 

other than Australia or New 

Zealand that the applicant wishes 

the Board to recognise as 

equivalent to such a qualification 

 $508 

 (d) if the application is in accordance 

with the mutual recognition 

principle or the Trans-Tasman 

mutual recognition principle 

 $140 

 (e) if the applicant holds provisional 

or non-practising registration 

 no fee 

3. Fee payable by a person who applies for 

limited registration —  

s. 10(2)(e)  

 (a) if the application involves the 

consideration for approval of a 

qualification or qualifications 

conferred by a body that is not 

established, or primarily based, in 

Australia or New Zealand 

 $568 

 (b) if the application involves a 

nominee participating in a teacher 

exchange programme approved by 

the Board for the purpose of this 

item 

 no fee 

 (c) otherwise  $235 

4. Fee payable by a person who applies for 

non-practising registration —  

s. 10(2)(e)  

 (a) eligible under section 18(a) of the 

Act 

 no fee 

 (b) eligible under section 18(b) of the 

Act — 

  

  (i) if the applicant has a 

teaching qualification from 

an accredited initial teacher 

education programme 

 $178 

  (ii) if the applicant has a 

teaching qualification 

conferred in Australia or 

New Zealand that the 

applicant wishes the Board 

to recognise as equivalent to 

such a qualification 

 $178 



16 June 2023 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1709 

 Type of fee Provision  

of Act or 

regulations 

Fee 

  (iii) if the applicant has a 

teaching qualification 

conferred in a country other 

than Australia or New 

Zealand that the applicant 

wishes the Board to 

recognise as equivalent to 

such a qualification 

 $508 

5. Fee payable by a person who applies for 

the renewal of registration 

s. 11(2)(d) $56 

6. Annual fee —  s. 35  

 (a) for the first year after registration 

is granted if it is granted in 

January, February, March, 

October, November or December 

 $47 

 (b) otherwise  $95 

7. Fee payable by a person for a criminal 

record check, obtained by the Board 

with consent of the person under 

section 44 of the Act 

s. 128(2)(i) $59 

8. Fee payable by a person who applies for 

a certified copy of the register or an 

entry in the register for the copy 

s. 37(5) $59 per 

entry up to 

a maximum 

fee of $170 

9. Late payment processing fee r. 28(5) $59 

10. Fee payable for a replacement 

registration card 

r. 20(4) $59 

11. Fee payable by a person seeking advice 

about additional qualifications required 

for registration 

r. 19(2)(a)(i) 

or (ii) 

$330 

12. Fee payable by a person seeking advice 

about being a fit and proper person to be 

registered 

r. 19(2)(b) $59 

N. HAGLEY, Clerk of the Executive Council. 


